C te and Partnershi

Income Tax Code and Regulations

Steven A. Bank
Kirk J. Stark

2015-2016 Edition

- lIFOUNDATION
PRESS



CORPORATE AND
PARTNERSHIP
INCOME TAX
CODE AND
REGULATIONS

SELECTED SECTIONS
2015-2016

by

STEVEN A. BANK

Paul Hastings Professor of Business Law
UCLA School of Law

KIRK J. STARK

Barrall Family Professoriof Tax Law and Policy
UELA School of Law

lFOUNDATION
PRESS



The publisher is not engaged in rendering legal or other professional advice, and this publication is not a substitute for the
advice of an attorney. If you require legal or other expert advice, you should seek the services of a competent attorney or
other professional.

© 2002-2004 FOUNDATION PRESS

© 2005-2012 by THOMSON REUTERS/FOUNDATION PRESS
© 2013 LEG, Inc. d/b/a West Academic Publishing

© 2014 LEG, Inc. d/b/a West Academic

© 2015 LEG, Inc. d/b/a West Academic

444 Cedar Street, Suite 700
St. Paul, MN 55101
1-877-888-1330

Printed in the United States of America
ISBN: 978-1-63459-390-8

[No claim of copyright is made for official U.S. government statutes, rules or regulations.]



Contents

SUBUUE AT TAREE cumsusroneosotsrsor s it s e i s i g s S GrPS RIS TSRS SRS R 1
Chapter 1 —Normal TaXeS OF SUITAXES .....ecveeuieueiriereeteeeceeenrerreeereerneeseesseseesnesseesuessnenseree |
Subchapter A— Determination of Tax Liability........cceceiiievirininiioimiens e cersssnsecneseens 1
Part I—Tax on Individuals .........coooiiieiiiiiiicircce et 1
Path "1 G O O DT ATIOMS eporeregosssvmmmrpusme s swaaresssss oy go g pess st 6 SR LR YNE RS TN 7
Subchapter B—Computation of Taxable INCOME ..........ccoovviiriiiiiiiciiiicicn e 8
Patt I—Definilion oF GIuss JHCOMIBY copossscsmmpusosmvsssssssssspssssmmimpesssss s ssyiss sy caapsm s i1 8
Part VI—Itemized Deductions for COrporations ............cccecueouereerearisinnieseessmeeesneneens 17
Part VIII—Special Deductions for COrporations ..........cccoreieeiiincinnionime: 20
Part IX—Items not Deductible...........c.cooviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiciiicicci s 25
Subchapter C—Corporate Distributions and Adjustments ..........cccccuiieiieniniiiesiineininns 33
Part I—Distributions by COIrPOTAtionsS ..........cccccerueruirirereenerecniienre e raesrecseeeeseneeseens 33
Subpart A—EHeets:on RECIPIONIS . wmmrmniswsarmnmmasupmys s sormmassspmsmnss 33
Subpart B—Effects 0n COrpOration ...........cccoieeeeirmiieeiececrerieeiee e enesmeseesenenene 47
Subpart C—Definitions; Constructive Ownership of Stock..........cocviiciiiiiiiiinncnane. 55
Part I1—Corporate Liquidations .........cccccocciimiiiiiiiiiiiincnsiicicssssiesssesiesaesesasaeens 59
Subpait A=EHects 6 RECIPIEAES o oo susrimmms ar s oy s sty 59
Subpart B—Effects on COrporation ... esensens 61
Subpart D— Definition and Special Rule .........cccciviniiiiiiim e, 69
Part III—Corporate Organizations and Reorganizations ...........cccocoeieviiiicreniniiiniinons 69
Subpart A—Corporate’ OTSAMIZAtIONG . e sesesvesws ssvimsisevsarsis s o vassn i35 s esayss A5 searasusads 69
Subpart B—Effects on Shareholders and Security Holders ........c.cccocevevcrenierennnenne. 72
Subpart C—Effects on COrporation .........c.eoveciicieieenimiisieesnscresissssssseseessesessesieen 89
Subpart D—Special Rule; Definitions.........coeoireiimieininenineeienereeerenee e seenenes 92
PATE Ve AT N OVOTE svvsssnn susousstvmnmsssnns sssesss v s sxass vssse s 165 54 ma083 8345 HUSHSoaioRTo FE RN NI SH 3RS 96
Part VI—Treatment of Certain Corporate
Interests as Stock or Indebtedness.......ccocvviiiiiiiiicnic 115
Subchapter E— Accounting Periods and Methods of Accounting..........cccocevivvninienieinnas 116
Part IT — Methods of ACCOUNTING ........cooiiiiiiiiiiiccie et 116
PArE T —=AdJUSEMAGIIER .uvosmuncnsussmsmsivessonssssverssas o s ssemsssses s is saidasasns sos svassssassmaavansasanes 116
Subchapter G— Corporations Used to Avoid Income Tax on Shareholders .................... 117
Part I—Corporations Improperly Accumulating Surplus ......ccccoovneisieieiiveemiomeiinn 117
Part II—Personal Holding COMPANIES ......c.coveruiiririnieniniinicieiiieessescsis e see e sie e 121
Part IV —Deduction for Dividends Paid ..........ccccouviriiiiionniieercesee e 127
Subehapter K —Partners and PastherShips.......cnmmmcmmmaim s sy 131
Part I —Determination of Tax Liability ...........cccooiiiiioiiiii e 131
Part II—Contributions, Distributions, and Transfers ... 141
Subpart A—Contributions to a Partnership .........cccccoceeveeiieceinnnceccnienneeieseenenns 141
Subpart B—Distributions by a Partnership ........c.cceceeeerienrinieminimsninesienesesssesiannes 142
Subpart C—Transfers of Interest in a Partnership..........ccocoeeevnceeeieninccecsicnnennns 152

Subpart D—Provisions Common to Other Subparts

iii



Part III — Definitions

..................................................................................................... 157

Part IV—Special Rules for Electing Large Partnerships .........ccccoccveeviniirniniciecns 159

Subchapter O—Gain or Loss on Disposition of Property .......c.cocooevevesiovcvevncniencnnons 165

Part I—Determination of Amount of and Recognition of Gain or LosS ........cccccceeuen. 165

Part II—Basis Rules of General AppliCation -........c.coccveeisieiirnisissrerniveesassmssrrsrseressans 166

Part III—Common Nontaxable EXChanges.........ccoceccviiiiiiiciininiciccnesecceeas 168

Part IV —Special RUIES .uussmsusissssssmosisisassnmssimassstosmsassssssssnssasssessssssismmsansn s 170

Subchapter P—Capital Gains and LOSSES.......cccoeiiiiiiiiiiiiiiecicicecicecnecrecscseaeee s 174

Part [—Treatment of Capital GAINS ..c.qcoszvsussssessssissivsasossssnsssmisvsssasssisisisssssnss svsssazesss 174

Part II— Treatment of Capital LOSSES....couciiiiieiiiiiiiicnticrcteeee ettt eaesaeas LI

Part 111 —General Rules for Determining Capital Gains and LOSSeS ........c.ccveviireenin 179
Subchapter S—Tax Treatment of S Corporations and

Their SharehOIAErsS .....c..ooueeiiiiee ittt 189

Part {—In GONCTAL s vssssirsrmvmiissinsss aasaimmamesisssdiss rsmmrisis i wwi s Aass e s vaasias s sa mavats 189

Part III—Special RULES ..ottt e 206

Part IV —Definitions; MiSCellan€ous ........ccccicviinmmimimimiimmiimimmmemimesmmmmimas 213

Chapter 6—Consolidated RTINS .....c.ooivieiiriiiiiiiiciiiie sttt st s cte e e eve e 215

Subchapter A—Returns and Payment of TaX .....c.cccvivnririniiincniiiinennen 215

Subchapter B—Related RUIES ......occciiiiiiiiciiii ittt 219

Part I—INiGeneral o sssmasmomsmarsmssamsmiomeamssos iworisrsssmasmsmisissins s moimomessesissisonesss 219

Part I[I—Certain Controlled COrporations ........c...ceieeieericenimiesscianseeesreesereesieessssenns 221

Subtitle F—Procedure and AdminiStration :..cueirwsissvemsasasssssssisisessssssrsmsivessssasssssiiesssssnion 227

Chapter 79 —DEefINIEIONS .....viviuiieiieiiririeci e te st st rae e ssrae s e e s vae s saaeesae e b ae e bassnesen 227

Treasury RegUIAtONS .....uwsivseomsmsrmamsassoars coaes s aioiss as sassavssiomesssomse i snesisssisiamenssssshyssnas 233

Computation of Taxable INCOME ... 233

Corporate Distributions and Adjustments ...........ccooeiiriniiionnieiensiiesin e saeeneees 254

Corporations Used to Avoid Income Tax on Shareholders ..o 496

Partners and Partnerships wsvimuc avrsassissamivisniss warssssanssss sy sits e i auis i el mva s s sive 501

Gain or Loss on Disposition of PrOperty ..o 764

L 80y 110 711 () 17> O R N S U Y S e e PP 766

iv



TAX ON INDIVIDUALS § 1(e)

SUBTITLE A—INCOME TAXES
Current through April 1, 2015
Chapter 1 —Normal Taxes or Surtaxes
Subchapter A —Determination of Tax Liability

Part I —Tax on Individuals

§ 1. Tax imposed

(a) Married individuals filing joint returns and surviving spouses.— There is hereby im-
posed on the taxable income of —

(1) every married individual (as defined in section 7703) who makes a single return jointly
with his spouse under section 6013, and

(2) every surviving spouse (as defined in section 2(a)),

a tax determined in accordance with the following table:

If taxable income is: The tax is:
Not over $36,900 .....coveeviririnieiiarinieieeiennns 15% of taxable income.
Over $36,900 but not over $89,150 .............. $5.535, plus 28% of the excess over $36.900.
Over $89,150 but not over $140,000 ............ $20,165, plus 31% of the excess over $89,150.
Over $140.000 but not over $250,000 .......... $35.928.50, plus 36% of the excess over $140,000.
OVer $250,000 ....ovveeeeiriiicirieeeiinieceienseesaseenas $75.528.50, plus 39.6% of the excess over
$250.000.

* k%

(¢) Unmarried individuals (other than surviving spouses and heads of households).—
There is hereby imposed on the taxable income of every individual (other than a surviving
spouse as defined in section 2(a) or the head of a household as defined in section 2(b)) who is

not a married individual (as defined in section 7703) a tax determined in accordance with the
following table:

If taxable income is: The tax is:

Not over $22,100 .ccovieirereeeeceeeeieeieerine e 15% of taxable income.

Over $22,100 but not over $53,500 .............. $3,315, plus 28% of the excess over $22,100.

Over $53,500 but not over $115,000 ............ $12.107, plus 31% of the excess over $53,500.

Over $115.,000 but not over $250,000 . ......... $31,172, plus 36% of the excess over $115,000.

OVer $250,000 ..cooeviieieiereiiieee e e e e $79,772, plus 39.6% of the excess over $250,000.
* % %

(e) Estates and trusts.—There is hereby imposed on the taxable income of —
(1) every estate, and

(2) every trust,

taxable under this subsection a tax determined in accordance with the following table:



§ 1(e) INCOME TAX REGULATIONS

If taxable iNCOME iS: .......coceeeeeeereciniiiecninnnn The tax is:

Not over $1,500 15% of taxable income.

Over $1,500 but not over $3,500 ......cccccvvnevee $225, plus 28% of the excess over $1,500.

Over $3,500 but not over $5,500 . ................. $785, plus 31% of the excess over $3,500.

Over $5.500 but not over $7.500 .................. $1.405, plus 36% of the excess over $5,500.

OVEr $7,500 ..ot $2,125, plus 39.6% of the excess over $7,500.
* ok ok

(h) Maximum capital gains rate.—

(1) In general.—If a taxpayer has a net capital gain for any taxable year, the tax imposed
by this section for such taxable year shall not exceed the sum of —

(A) a tax computed at the rates and in the same manner as if this subsection had not
been enacted on the greater of —

(i) taxable income reduced by the net capital gain; or

(ii) the lesser of —
(I) the amount of taxable income taxed at a rate below 25 percent; or
(II) taxable income reduced by the adjusted net capital gain,

(B) 0 percent of so much of the adjusted net capital gain (or, if less, taxable income) as
does not exceed the excess (if any) of —

(i) the amount of taxable income which would (without regard to this paragraph)
be taxed at a rate below 25 percent, over

(ii) the taxable income reduced by the adjusted net capital gain;

(C) 15 percent of the lesser of —

(i) so much of the adjusted net capital gain (or, if less, taxable income) as exceeds
the amount on which a tax is determined under subparagraph (B), or

(ii) the excess of —

(I) the amount of taxable income which would (without regard to this para-
graph) be taxed at a rate below 39.6 percent, over

(IT) the sum of the amounts on which a tax is determined under subparagraphs
(A) and (B),

(D) 20 percent of the adjusted net capital gain (or, if less, taxable income) in excess
of the sum of the amounts on which tax is determined under subparagraphs (B) and (C),

(E) 25 percent of the excess (if any) of —

(i) the unrecaptured section 1250 gain (or, if less, the net capital gain (determined
without regard to paragraph (11))), over

(ii) the excess (if any) of —

(I) the sum of the amount on which tax is determined under subparagraph (A)
plus the net capital gain, over

(IT) taxable income; and



TAX ON INDIVIDUALS § 1(h)

(F) 28 percent of the amount of taxable income in excess of the sum of the amounts
on which tax is determined under the preceding subparagraphs of this paragraph.

(2) Net capital gain taken into account as investment income.—For purposes of this
subsection, the net capital gain for any taxable year shall be reduced (but not below zero) by

the amount which the taxpayer takes into account as investment income under section 163(d)
(4)(B)(iii).

(3) Adjusted net capital gain.—For purposes of this subsection, the term “adjusted net
capital gain” means the sum of —

(A) net capital gain (determined without regard to paragraph (11)) reduced (but not
below zero) by the sum of —

(i) unrecaptured section 1250 gain, and
(ii) 28-percent rate gain, plus
(B) qualified dividend income (as defined in paragraph (11)).

(4) 28 percent rate gain.—For purposes of this subsection, the term “28-percent rate
gain” means the excess (if any) of —

(A) the sum of —
(i) collectibles gain; and
(ii) section 1202 gain, over
(B) the sum of —
(i) collectibles loss;
(ii) the net short-term capital loss; and

(iii) the amount of long-term capital loss carried under section 1212(b)(1)(B) to
the taxable year.

(5) Collectibles gain and loss.— For purposes of this subsection—

(A) In general.—The terms “collectibles gain” and “collectibles loss” mean gain or
loss (respectively) from the sale or exchange of a collectible (as defined in section 408(m)
without regard to paragraph (3) thereof) which is a capital asset held for more than 1 year
but only to the extent such gain is taken into account in computing gross income and such
loss is taken into account in computing taxable income.

(B) Partnerships, etc.—For purposes of subparagraph (A), any gain from the sale
of an interest in a partnership, S corporation, or trust which is attributable to unrealized
appreciation in the value of collectibles shall be treated as gain from the sale or exchange

of a collectible. Rules similar to the rules of section 751 shall apply for purposes of the
preceding sentence.

(6) Unrecaptured section 1250 gain.—For purposes of this subsection—

(A) In general.—The term “unrecaptured section 1250 gain” means the excess (if
any) of —

(i) the amount of long-term capital gain (not otherwise treated as ordinary income)
which would be treated as ordinary income if section 1250(b)(1) included all depre-
ciation and the applicable percentage under section 1250(a) were 100 percent, over



§ 1(h) INCOME TAX REGULATIONS

(ii) the excess (if any) of —
(I) the amount described in paragraph (4)(B); over
(IT) the amount described in paragraph (4)(A).

(B) Limitation with respect to section 1231 property.—The amount described in
subparagraph (A)(i) from sales, exchanges, and conversions described in section 1231(a)
(3)(A) for any taxable year shall not exceed the net section 1231 gain (as defined in sec-
tion 1231(c)(3)) for such year.

(7) Section 1202 gain
For purposes of this subsection, the term “section 1202 gain” means the excess of —

(A) the gain which would be excluded from gross income under section 1202 but for
the percentage limitation in section 1202(a), over

(B) the gain excluded from gross income under section 1202.

(8) Coordination with recapture of net ordinary losses under section 1231.—If any
amount is treated as ordinary income under section 1231(c), such amount shall be allocated
among the separate categories of net section 1231 gain (as defined in section 1231(c)(3)) in
such manner as the Secretary may by forms or regulations prescribe.

(9) Regulations.—The Secretary may prescribe such regulations as are appropriate (in-

cluding regulations requiring reporting) to apply this subsection in the case of sales and
exchanges by pass-thru entities and of interests in such entities.

(10) Pass-thru entity defined.—For purposes of this subsection, the term “pass-thru en-
tity” means—

(A) a regulated investment company;

(B) a real estate investment trust;

(C) an S corporation;

(D) a partnership;

(E) an estate or trust;

(F) a common trust fund; and

(G) a qualified electing fund (as defined in section 1295).
(11) Dividends taxed as net capital gain.—

(A) In general.— For purposes of this subsection, the term ‘net capital gain” means net

capital gain (determined without regard to this paragraph) increased by qualified dividend
income.

(B) Qualified dividend income.— For purposes of this paragraph—

(i) In general.—The term ‘qualified dividend income’ means dividends received
during the taxable year from—

(I) domestic corporations, and
(IT) qualified foreign corporations.

(ii) Certain dividends excluded.— Such term shall not include—



TAX ON INDIVIDUALS § 1(h)

(I) any dividend from a corporation which for the taxable year of the corpora-
tion in which the distribution is made, or the preceding taxable year, is a corpora-
tion exempt from tax under section 501 or 521,

(IT) any amount allowed as a deduction under section 591 (relating to deduction
for dividends paid by mutual savings banks, etc.), and

(III) any dividend described in section 404(k).

(iii) Coordination with section 246(c).— Such term shall not include any dividend
on any share of stock—

(I) with respect to which the holding period requirements of section 246(c) are
not met (determined by substituting in section 246(c) “60 days” for “45 days” each
place it appears and by substituting “121-day period” for “91-day period”), or

(IT) to the extent that the taxpayer is under an obligation (whether pursuant to
a short sale or otherwise) to make related payments with respect to positions in
substantially similar or related property.

(C) Qualified foreign corporations.—

(i) In general.—Except as otherwise provided in this paragraph, the term ‘quali-
fied foreign corporation’ means any foreign corporation if —

(I) such corporation is incorporated in a possession of the United States, or

(IT) such corporation is eligible for benefits of a comprehensive income tax
treaty with the United States which the Secretary determines is satisfactory for pur-
poses of this paragraph and which includes an exchange of information program.

(ii) Dividends on stock readily tradable on United States securities mar-
ket.— A foreign corporation not otherwise treated as a qualified foreign corporation
under clause (i) shall be so treated with respect to any dividend paid by such corpora-
tion if the stock with respect to which such dividend is paid is readily tradable on an
established securities market in the United States.

(iii) Exclusion of dividends of certain foreign corporations.—Such term shall
not include any foreign corporation which for the taxable year of the corporation in
which the dividend was paid, or the preceding taxable year, is a passive foreign invest-
ment company (as defined in section 1297).

(iv) Coordination with foreign tax credit limitation.—Rules similar to the rules
of section 904(b)(2)(B) shall apply with respect to the dividend rate differential under
this paragraph.

(D) Special rules.—

(i) Amounts taken inte account as investment income.—Qualified dividend in-
come shall not include any amount which the taxpayer takes into account as invest-
ment income under section 163(d)(4)(B).

(ii) Extraordinary dividends.—If an individual receives, with respect to any share
of stock, qualified dividend income from 1 or more dividends which are extraordinary
dividends (within the meaning of section 1059(c)), any loss on the sale or exchange of
such share shall, to the extent of such dividends, be treated as long-term capital loss.



§ 1(h) INCOME TAX REGULATIONS

(iii) Treatment of dividends from regulated investment companies and real es-
tate investment trusts.— A dividend received from a regulated investment company

or a real estate investment trust shall be subject to the limitations prescribed in sections
854 and 857.

(i) Rate reductions after 2000.—
(1) 10-percent rate bracket.—
(A) In general.—In the case of taxable years beginning after December 31, 2000 —

(i) the rate of tax under subsections (a), (b), (¢), and (d) on taxable income not over
the initial bracket amount shall be 10 percent, and

(ii) the 15 percent rate of tax shall apply only to taxable income over the initial

bracket amount but not over the maximum dollar amount for the 15-percent rate brack-
et.

(B) Initial bracket amount.—For purposes of this paragraph, the initial bracket
amount is—

(i) $14.,000 in the case of subsection (a),
(ii) $10.000 in the case of subsection (b), and

(iii) 1/2 the amount applicable under clause (i) (after adjustment, if any, under sub-
paragraph (C)) in the case of subsections (c) and (d).

(C) Inflation adjustment.— In prescribing the tables under subsection (f) which apply
with respect to taxable years beginning in calendar years after 2003 —

(i) the cost-of-living adjustment shall be determined under subsection (f)(3) by
substituting “2002” for *1992” in subparagraph (B) thereof, and

(ii) the adjustments under clause (i) shall not apply to the amount referred to in
subparagraph (B)(iii).

If any amount after adjustment under the preceding sentence is not a multiple of $50, such
amount shall be rounded to the next lowest multiple of $50.

(2) 25-, 28-, and 33-percent rate brackets — The tables under subsections (a), (b), (c),
(d), and (e) shall be applied—

(A) by substituting “25%" for “28%" each place it appears (before the application of
subparagraph (B)),

(B) by substituting “28%" for “31%" each place it appears, and
(C) by substituting “33%" for “36%" each place it appears.

(3) Modifications to income tax brackets for high-income taxpayers

(A) 35-percent rate bracket—In the case of taxable years beginning after December
31,2012—

(i) the rate of tax under subsections (a), (b), (c), and (d) on a taxpayer’s taxable
income in the highest rate bracket shall be 35 percent to the extent such income does
not exceed an amount equal to the excess of —



TAX ON CORPORATIONS § 11(b)

(I) the applicable threshold, over
(IT) the dollar amount at which such bracket begins, and

(ii) the 39.6 percent rate of tax under such subsections shall apply only to the

taxpayer’s taxable income in such bracket in excess of the amount to which clause (i)
applies.

(B) Applicable threshold—For purposes of this paragraph, the term “applicable
threshold™ means —

(i) $450.,000 in the case of subsection (a),
(ii) $425.,000 in the case of subsection (b),
(iii) $400.000 in the case of subsection (c¢), and

(iv) 1/2 the amount applicable under clause (i) (after adjustment, if any, under sub-
paragraph (C)) in the case of subsection (d).

(C) Inflation adjustment—For purposes of this paragraph, with respect to taxable
years beginning in calendar years after 2013, each of the dollar amounts under clauses
(1), (i), and (iii) of subparagraph (B) shall be adjusted in the same manner as under para-

graph (1)(C)(i), except that subsection (f)(3)(B) shall be applied by substituting “2012"
for *1992”,

(4) Adjustment of tables—The Secretary shall adjust the tables prescribed under subsec-
tion (f) to carry out this subsection.

Part II—Tax on Corporations

§ 11. Tax imposed.

(a) Corporations in general. A tax is hereby imposed for each taxable year on the taxable
income of every corporation.

(b) Amount of tax.

(1) In general. The amount of the tax imposed by subsection (a) shall be the sum of —
(A) 15 percent of so much of the taxable income as does not exceed $50,000,

(B) 25 percent of so much of the taxable income as exceeds $50,000 but does not
exceed $75.000,

(C) 34 percent of so much of the taxable income as exceeds $75,000 but does not
exceed $10,000,000, and

(D) 35 percent of so much of the taxable income as exceeds $10,000,000.

In the case of a corporation which has taxable income in excess of $100,000 for any
taxable year, the amount of tax determined under the preceding sentence for such taxable
year shall be increased by the lesser of (i) 5 percent of such excess, or (ii) $11,750. In the
case of a corporation which has taxable income in excess of $15,000.,000, the amount of
the tax determined under the foregoing provisions of this paragraph shall be increased by
an additional amount equal to the lesser of (i) 3 percent of such excess, or (ii) $100,000.

(2) Certain personal service corporations not eligible for graduated rates. Notwith-
standing paragraph (1), the amount of the tax imposed by subsection (a) on the taxable in-



§ 11(b) INCOME TAX REGULATIONS

come of a qualified personal service corporation (as defined in section 448(d)(2)) shall be
equal to 35 percent of the taxable income.

(c) Exceptions. Subsection (a) shall not apply to a corporation subject to a tax imposed by —
(1) section 594 (relating to mutual savings banks conducting life insurance business),
(2) subchapter L (sec. 801 and following, relating to insurance companies), or

(3) subchapter M (sec. 851 and following, relating to regulated investment companies and
real estate investment trusts).

(d) Foreign corporations. In the case of a foreign corporation, the taxes imposed by subsec-
tion (a) and section 55 shall apply only as provided by section 882.

¥ sk K

Subchapter B— Computation of Taxable Income
Part I —Definition of Gross Income

§ 83. Property transferred in connection with performance of services.

(a) General rule.—If, in connection with the performance of services, property is transferred
to any person other than the person for whom such services are performed, the excess of —

(1) the fair market value of such property (determined without regard to any restriction
other than a restriction which by its terms will never lapse) at the first time the rights of the

person having the beneficial interest in such property are transferable or are not subject to a
substantial risk of forfeiture, whichever occurs earlier, over

(2) the amount (if any) paid for such property,

shall be included in the gross income of the person who performed such services in the first
taxable year in which the rights of the person having the beneficial interest in such property are
transferable or are not subject to a substantial risk of forfeiture, whichever is applicable. The
preceding sentence shall not apply if such person sells or otherwise disposes of such property in

an arm’s length transaction before his rights in such property become transferable or not subject
to a substantial risk of forfeiture.

(b) Election to include in gross income in year of transfer.—

(1) In general.— Any person who performs services in connection with which property
is transferred to any person may elect to include in his gross income, for the taxable year in
which such property is transferred, the excess of —

(A) the fair market value of such property at the time of transfer (determined without
regard to any restriction other than a restriction which by its terms will never lapse), over

(B) the amount (if any) paid for such property.

If such election is made, subsection (a) shall not apply with respect to the transfer of such prop-

erty, and if such property is subsequently forfeited, no deduction shall be allowed in respect of
such forfeiture.

(2) Election.— An election under paragraph (1) with respect to any transfer of property
shall be made in such manner as the Secretary prescribes and shall be made not later than 30



DEFINITION OF GROSS INCOME § 83(e)

days after the date of such transfer. Such election may not be revoked except with the consent
of the Secretary.

(c) Special rules.— For purposes of this section—

(1) Substantial risk of forfeiture.—The rights of a person in property are subject to a
substantial risk of forfeiture if such person’s rights to full enjoyment of such property are
conditioned upon the future performance of substantial services by any individual.

(2) Transferability of property.— The rights of a person in property are transferable only
if the rights in such property of any transferee are not subject to a substantial risk of forfeiture.

(3) Sales which may give rise to suit under Section 16(b) of the Securities Exchange
Act of 1934.—So long as the sale of property at a profit could subject a person to suit under

section 16(b) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, such person’s rights in such property
are—

(A) subject to a substantial risk of forfeiture, and
(B) not transferable.

(4) For purposes of determining an individual’s basis in property transferred in connection
with the performance of services, rules similar to the rules of section 72(w) shall apply.

(d) Certain restrictions which will never lapse.—

(1) Valuation.—In the case of property subject to a restriction which by its terms will
never lapse, and which allows the transferee to sell such property only at a price determined
under a formula, the price so determined shall be deemed to be the fair market value of the

property unless established to the contrary by the Secretary, and the burden of proof shall be
on the Secretary with respect to such value.

(2) Cancellation.—If, in the case of property subject to a restriction which by its terms
will never lapse, the restriction is canceled, then, unless the taxpayer establishes —

(A) that such cancellation was not compensatory, and

(B) that the person, if any, who would be allowed a deduction if the cancellation were
treated as compensatory, will treat the transaction as not compensatory, as evidenced in
such manner as the Secretary shall prescribe by regulations,

the excess of the fair market value of the property (computed without regard to the restrictions)
at the time of cancellation over the sum of —

(C) the fair market value of such property (computed by taking the restriction into
account) immediately before the cancellation, and

(D) the amount, if any, paid for the cancellation,
shall be treated as compensation for the taxable year in which such cancellation occurs.
(e) Applicability of section.—This section shall not apply to—
(1) a transaction to which section 421 applies,

(2) a transfer to or from a trust described in section 401(a) or a transfer under an annuity
plan which meets the requirements of section 404(a)(2),

(3) the transfer of an option without a readily ascertainable fair market value,



§ 83(e) INCOME TAX REGULATIONS

(4) the transfer of property pursuant to the exercise of an option with a readily ascertain-
able fair market value at the date of grant, or

(5) group-term life insurance to which section 79 applies.

(f) Holding period.—In determining the period for which the taxpayer has held property to
which subsection (a) applies, there shall be included only the period beginning at the first time

his rights in such property are transferable or are not subject to a substantial risk of forfeiture,
whichever occurs earlier.

(g) Certain exchanges.—If property to which subsection (a) applies is exchanged for prop-
erty subject to restrictions and conditions substantially similar to those to which the property
given in such exchange was subject, and if section 354, 355, 356, or 1036 (or so much of section

1031 as relates to section 1036) applied to such exchange, or if such exchange was pursuant to
the exercise of a conversion privilege—

(1) such exchange shall be disregarded for purposes of subsection (a), and
(2) the property received shall be treated as property to which subsection (a) applies.

(h) Deduction by employer.—In the case of a transfer of property to which this section
applies or a cancellation of a restriction described in subsection (d), there shall be allowed as a
deduction under section 162, to the person for whom were performed the services in connection
with which such property was transferred, an amount equal to the amount included under sub-
section (a), (b), or (d)(2) in the gross income of the person who performed such services. Such
deduction shall be allowed for the taxable year of such person in which or with which ends the

taxable year in which such amount is included in the gross income of the person who performed
such services.

¥ ok ok

§ 108. Income from discharge of indebtedness.
(a) Exclusion from gross income.—

(1) In general—Gross income does not include any amount which (but for this subsec-

tion) would be includible in gross income by reason of the discharge (in whole or in part) of
indebtedness of the taxpayer if —

(A) the discharge occurs in a title 11 case,
(B) the discharge occurs when the taxpayer is insolvent,
(C) the indebtedness discharged is qualified farm indebtedness, or

(D) in the case of a taxpayer other than a C corporation, the indebtedness discharged
is qualified real property business indebtedness.

E3 3 3
(2) Coordination of exclusions.—

(A) Title 11 exclusion takes precedence.— Subparagraphs (B), (C), and (D) of para-
graph (1) shall not apply to a discharge which occurs in a title 11 case.



DEFINITION OF GROSS INCOME § 108(b)

(B) Insolvency exclusion takes precedence over qualified farm exclusion and
qualified real property business exclusion.— Subparagraphs (C) and (D) of paragraph
(1) shall not apply to a discharge to the extent the taxpayer is insolvent.

* ok ok

(3) Insolvency exclusion limited to amount of insolvency.—In the case of a discharge
to which paragraph (1)(B) applies, the amount excluded under paragraph (1)(B) shall not
exceed the amount by which the taxpayer is insolvent.

(b) Reduction of tax attributes.—

(1) In general.—The amount excluded from gross income under subparagraph (A), (B),

or (C) of subsection (a)(1) shall be applied to reduce the tax attributes of the taxpayer as
provided in paragraph (2).

(2) Tax attributes affected; order of reduction.—Except as provided in paragraph (5),

the reduction referred to in paragraph (1) shall be made in the following tax attributes in the
following order:

(A) NOL.— Any net operating loss for the taxable year of the discharge, and any net
operating loss carryover to such taxable year.

(B) General business credit.— Any carryover to or from the taxable year of a dis-
charge of an amount for purposes for determining the amount allowable as a credit under
section 38 (relating to general business credit).

(C) Minimum tax credit.—The amount of the minimum tax credit available under

section 53(b) as of the beginning of the taxable year immediately following the taxable
year of the discharge.

(D) Capital loss carryovers.—Any net capital loss for the taxable year of the dis-
charge, and any capital loss carryover to such taxable year under section 1212.
(E) Basis reduction.—
(i) In general.—The basis of the property of the taxpayer.

(ii) Cross reference.— For provisions for making the reduction described in clause
(i), see section 1017.

(F) Passive activity loss and credit carryovers.— Any passive activity loss or credit
carryover of the taxpayer under section 469(b) from the taxable year of the discharge.

(G) Foreign tax credit carryovers.— Any carryover to or from the taxable year of the
discharge for purposes of determining the amount of the credit allowable under section
27.

(3) Amount of reduction.—

(A) In general.—Except as provided in subparagraph (B), the reductions described in
paragraph (2) shall be one dollar for each dollar excluded by subsection (a).

(B) Credit carryover reduction.—The reductions described in subparagraphs (B),
(C), and (G) shall be 33 1/3 cents for each dollar excluded by subsection (a). The reduc-

tion described in subparagraph (F) in any passive activity credit carryover shall be 33 1/3
cents for each dollar excluded by subsection (a).

11



§ 108(b) INCOME TAX REGULATIONS

(4) Ordering rules.—

(A) Reductions made after determination of tax for year.—The reductions de-

scribed in paragraph (2) shall be made after the determination of the tax imposed by this
chapter for the taxable year of the discharge.

(B) Reductions under subparagraph (A) or (D) of paragraph (2).—The reductions
described in subparagraph (A) or (D) of paragraph (2) (as the case may be) shall be made
first in the loss for the taxable year of the discharge and then in the carryovers to such
taxable year in the order of the taxable years from which each such carryover arose.

(C) Reductions under subparagraphs (B) and (G) of paragraph (2).—The reduc-
tions described in subparagraphs (B) and (G) of paragraph (2) shall be made in the order

in which carryovers are taken into account under this chapter for the taxable year of the
discharge.

(5) Election to apply reduction first against depreciable property.—

(A) In general.—The taxpayer may elect to apply any portion of the reduction re-
ferred to in paragraph (1) to the reduction under section 1017 of the basis of the deprecia-
ble property of the taxpayer.

(B) Limitation.—The amount to which an election under subparagraph (A) applies
shall not exceed the aggregate adjusted bases of the depreciable property held by the

taxpayer as of the beginning of the taxable year following the taxable year in which the
discharge occurs.

(C) Other tax attributes not reduced.— Paragraph (2) shall not apply to any amount
to which an election under this paragraph applies.
(¢) Treatment of discharge of qualified real property business indebtedness.—
(1) Basis reduction.—

(A) In general.—The amount excluded from gross income under subparagraph (D)

of subsection (a)(1) shall be applied to reduce the basis of the depreciable real property
of the taxpayer.

(B) Cross reference.—For provisions making the reduction described in subpara-
graph (A), see section 1017.

(2) Limitations.—

(A) Indebtedness in excess of value.—The amount excluded under subparagraph (D)

of subsection (a)(1) with respect to any qualified real property business indebtedness shall
not exceed the excess (if any) of —

(i) the outstanding principal amount of such indebtedness (immediately before the
discharge), over

(ii) the fair market value of the real property described in paragraph (3)(A) (as of
such time), reduced by the outstanding principal amount of any other qualified real
property business indebtedness secured by such property (as of such time).

(B) Overall limitation.— The amount excluded under subparagraph (D) of subsection
(a)(1) shall not exceed the aggregate adjusted bases of depreciable real property (deter-
mined after any reductions under subsections (b) and (g)) held by the taxpayer immedi-

12



